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  NOTICE TO ALL SUPPLIERS! 
 

Suppliers need to be aware of the phishing scams! 

“National Treasury will NEVER ask you to click on a link to provide your 

CSD username and password. Please be vigilant when online.” 

 

SUPPLIERS MUST ALSO NOTE: 
 
 More details of the bid notices and conditions are available on E-

portal on this website:  

www.e-tenders.gov.za  / ADVERTISED 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
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ATTENTION TO ALL SUPPLIERS 

It has come to our attention that there are small businesses and co-

operatives in the Province who are manufacturing and supplying cloth 

masks but are not registered with the Department of Small Business 

as per the requirement of Paragraph 4.6 (d) of the National Treasury 

Instruction Note No. 05 of 2020/2021 and as such do not appear on the 

list accessible from the link that I had emailed earlier today. 

 

You are kindly requested to take note of the attached REQUEST FOR 

INFORMATION and small businesses and co-operatives are 

encouraged to register as advertised.  
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In addition, you can email Mr Kgolane Thulare from the Department of 

Small Business with requests on behalf of small businesses and co-

operatives for inclusion in the list. Please note that the closing date 

for registration has been moved to the end of May 2020 as per the 

trailing email from Mr Fani from the Office of the Chief Procurement 

Office within National Treasury. 

 

Mr Thulare’s email address is :  KThulare@dsbd.gov.za.  
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ERRATUM & EXTENSION OF CLOSING DATE 
DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION  

 
PTB NO. 

SCMU6-20/21-0001 - Request for proposals from suitably qualified and 
accredited training providers to facilitate the Implementation of Skills and 
Training Programmes in the Education Training and Development (ETD) 
sector for a period of three years with an option to extend for a period of 
not more than 24 months which will be at the discretion of the eastern 
cape department of education. 
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
Please note that the closing date for the above mentioned bid has been 
extended to 11h00 on Friday 4th September 2020. 
 
To ensure that submissions are done in a manner that is safe and which 
prevents the spread of the virus interested suppliers must register their 
interest or submit the returnable documents using the following link: 
https://ecdoe-scmu6-bid.azurewebsites.net                                                       

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr. P. Nxozana   

Tel: (040) 608 4524  

Email:pakamile.nxozana@ecdoe.gov.za 
 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC 

Ms L Sidiya 

Tel: (040) 608 4554 

Email: lukhanyo.sidiya@ecdoe.gov.za 

 

 
 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM  

 
PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU8-20/21-0129  - Supply and delivery of borehole casings at Dohne 
ADI, Stutterheim in the EC Province 
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
Pages 6 and 7 of the bid notice refers to submission of CIDB certificate.  
 
NO CIDB GRADING REQUIRED -  
Bid closing date will remain – 23 September 2020 @ 11:00 
                                          

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs. N. Mateta 
Tel: 040 602 6263 
Email:nosibusiso.minya@drdar.gov.za 
 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC 

Mr. J. Koch 
Tel: 043 683 4022 
Cell: 063 693 0652 
EMail:johan.koch@drdar.gov.za 
 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:pakamile.nxozana@ecdoe.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT, 
ENVIRONMENTAL 
AFFAIRS AND 
TOURISM 
(DEDEAT) 

 
PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU- PP09-20/21-15 - Appointment of a suitable service provider(s) to 
render cleaning and hygiene services on behalf of the Department of 
Economic Development, Environmental Affairs And Tourism 
(DEDEAT): head office (King William’s Town, Bhisho) for period of 
two(2) years  
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
Extension of the closing date to the 25 September 2020 at 11h00 
 
The tender documents are available on the departmental website 
(www.dedea.gov.za) 
 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms Hlokoma Mtshotshisa 
Tel: 043 605 7153/ 072 045 8528 
Email: 
Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.gov.za 
 
Ms Nosidima Tito 
Tel: 043 605 7191/ 082 959 3893 
Email: Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za 
 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

S. Mabongo  

Sandiso.Mabongo@dedea.gov.za 

 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT, 
ENVIRONMENTAL 
AFFAIRS AND 
TOURISM 
(DEDEAT) 

 
PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU- PP09-20/21-15 - Appointment of a suitable service provider(s) to 
render cleaning and hygiene services on behalf of the Department of 
Economic Development, Environmental Affairs And Tourism 
(DEDEAT) OR Tambo regional office for period of two (2) years  
Years  
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
Extension of the closing date to the 25 September 2020 at 11h00 
 
The tender documents are available on the departmental website 
(www.dedea.gov.za) 
 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms Hlokoma Mtshotshisa 
Tel: 043 605 7153/ 072 045 8528 
Email: 
Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.gov.za 
 
Ms Nosidima Tito 
Tel: 043 605 7191/ 082 959 3893 
Email: Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za 
 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

S. Mabongo  

Sandiso.Mabongo@dedea.gov.za 
 

 
 
 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.gov.za
mailto:Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT, 
ENVIRONMENTAL 
AFFAIRS AND 
TOURISM 
(DEDEAT) 

 
PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU- PP09-20/21-15 - Appointment of a suitable service provider(s) to 
render cleaning and hygiene services on behalf of the Department of Economic 
Development, Environmental Affairs And Tourism (DEDEAT) Sarah Baartman 
and its setelite offices (Jeffery’s bay, Graaff Reinet and Grahamstown) for 
period of two (2) years 
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
Extension of the closing date to the 25 September 2020 at 11h00 
 
The tender documents are available on the departmental website 
(www.dedea.gov.za) 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms Hlokoma Mtshotshisa 
Tel: 043 605 7153/ 072 045 8528 
Email: 
Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.gov.za 
 
Ms Nosidima Tito 
Tel: 043 605 7191/ 082 959 3893 
Email: Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za 
 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC 

S. Mabongo  

Sandiso.Mabongo@dedea.gov.za 

 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT, 
ENVIRONMENTAL 
AFFAIRS AND 
TOURISM 
(DEDEAT) 

PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU- PP09-20/21-01 - Appointment of service provider to render travel 
management services in respect of air travel,car hire, accommodation, venues 
and conference facilities for the period of three(3) years on behalf of the 
department 
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
Extension of the closing date to the 25 September 2020 at 11h00 
 
The tender documents are available on the departmental website 
(www.dedea.gov.za) 
 
NB: 25% must be subcontracted to one of the categories as listed in the 
tender documents, in line with regulation 4 of Preferential Procurement 
Regulation, 2017.   
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms Hlokoma Mtshotshisa 

Tel: 043 605 7153/ 072 045 8528 

Email:Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.g

ov.za 

 

Ms Nosidima Tito 

Tel: 043 605 7191/ 082 959 3893 

Email: Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

S. Hlwempu 

Sipho.Hlwempu@dedea.gov.za 

 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.gov.za
mailto:Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za
mailto:Sandiso.Mabongo@dedea.gov.za
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mailto:Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.gov.za
mailto:Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  HEAD OFFICE CONTACT 
PERSON 

DEPT OF 
PUBLIC 
WORKS 

PTB NO 
19 

SEE BELOW  SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 
Mr. Z. Billie  
Tel No: 040-602 4563 / 4000  
Cell No: 082 885 3425 during 
office hours  
Email Address: 
zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.
za  
 
TECHNICAL/PROJECT 
SPECIFIC  
Enquires: Mr W. Mnyombolo  
Tel No: 040 602 4554 / 4000 
Cell No: 076 423 9385 during 
office hours  
Email Address: 
welile.mnyombolo@ecdpw.g
ov.za     
 
  
 
  

BID NUMBER & DESCRIPTION DETAIL AS PER BID INVITATION & 
BID DOCUMENTS 

ERRATUM 

1. SCMU5-20/21-0078 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to Health & Safety cluster 

two for period of 36 months 

2. SCMU5-20/21-0079 

Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to O.R. Tambo cluster 

one for period of 36 months 

3. SCMU5-20/21-0080 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to O.R. Tambo cluster two 

for period of 36 months 

4. SCMU5-20/21-0081 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to Local Government 

cluster one for period of 36 months 

5. SCMU5-20/21-0082 

Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to Local Government 

cluster two for period of 36 months 

6. SCMU5-20/21-0083 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to Health & Safety cluster 

one for period of 36 months 

Compulsory briefing meeting will 
be held on 27 August 2020 at 
Bhisho contact centre 
 
 
- 
 
 
- 
 
 
- 
 
 
 
 
Phase four: evaluation on PPPFA/ 
BBBEE of 2011 
 
The total working experience of the 
company in the security industry 
must not be less than eight years 
 
Proof of relevant working 
experience in provision of security 
services   

 More than 10 years and above 
months                            = 40 points 

A. “Non” compulsory briefing 
meeting will be held on 27 August 
2020 at Bhisho contact centre 
 

B. Bidders can ask question, make 
comments using the provided 
contact official’s email addresses 

 

C. Last day to ask question is 10 
September 2020 

 

D. Responses to all questions is 17 
September 2020. Responses will be 
uploaded on departmental website. 
www.ecdpw.gov.za/tenders  

 

E. Phase four: evaluation on PPPFA/ 
BBBEE of 2017 
 

F. The total working experience of the 
company in the security industry 
must not be less than four years 

 

A. Proof of relevant company working 
experience in provision of security 
services  

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:welile.mnyombolo@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:welile.mnyombolo@ecdpw.gov.za
http://www.ecdpw.gov.za/tenders
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7. SCMU5-20/21-0084 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to Joe Gqabi cluster for 

period of 36 months 

8. SCMU5-20/21-0085 

Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to Alfred Nzo cluster for 

period of 36 months 

9. SCMU5-20/21-0086 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to OTP cluster for period 

of 36 months 

10. SCMU5-20/21-0087 
Appointment of service provider to provide 

security service to DPW cluster for period 

of 36 months 

 More than 9 years and eleven 
months                            = 30 points  

 More than 8 years and eleven  
months,                           = 20 points  

 Less than 8 years: Bidder will be 
eliminated for consideration 

 

 More than 08 years       = 40 points 

 More than 6 years to 8 years   = 30 
points 

 4 years to 6 years        = 20 points 
 

 Less than 4 years: Bidder will be 
eliminated for consideration 

DETAIL AS PER BID INVITATION (Tender Bulletin) ERRATUM 

SCMU5-19/20-0007 SCMU5-20/21-0007 

SCMU5-19/20-0042 SCMU5-20/21-0042 

SCMU5-19/20-0043 SCMU5-20/21-0043 

SCMU5-19/20-0049 SCMU5-20/21-0049 

SCMU5-19/20-0078 SCMU5-20/21-0078 
SCMU5-19/20-0079 SCMU5-20/21-0079 
SCMU5-19/20-0041 SCMU5-20/21-0041 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM  

 
PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU8-20/21-0111 - Supply and delivery of irrigation material for Imdara 
(Kariega) citrus development project in Sundays River Valley Local 
Municipality  
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
No CIDB Grading required as it is only Supply and Delivery 
                                                      

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr Z Mooi  

Cell No: 066 476 4195  

Email: Zongezile.Mooi@drdar.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC 

Mr G Rautenbach  

Cell: 083 447 1513 

Email:Skillie.Rautenbach@drdar.gov.za 

 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT OF 
RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM  

 
PTB NO.19 
20/21 FY 

SCMU8-20/21-0110 - Dam scooping and levelling of four dams in blue crane 
local municipality for Zwaartfontein, Jackson, constant and Mulderskraal 
farms 
 
REASONS FOR ERRATUM 
There is a CIDB Grading requirement of 2CE or higher 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr Z Mooi  

Cell No: 066 476 4195  

Email: Zongezile.Mooi@drdar.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC 

Mr G Rautenbach  

Cell: 083 447 1513 

Email:Skillie.Rautenbach@drdar.gov.za 
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BID NOTICES 
DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
NTINGA O.R. 
TAMBO 
DEVELOPMENT   

309/2020 Service and Maintenance of four (4) Kei Fresh 
Produce Market Cold Room for the period of 36 
months. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
03 September 2020 @11h00 in Mthatha, Kei Fresh 
Produce Market, 32 Errol Spring Avenue, Vulindlela 
Heights. 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Ntinga O.R. Tambo Development Agency Offices, 
Room 08, from 08h00 on 31 August 2020 @ a 
non-refundable deposit of R200.00 per document. . 
However, bidders who previously purchased this 
/ these bid document(s) will get them free of 
charge provided that there is proof of previous 
purchase. 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr O Muteyi 

Tel: 047 495 0528, 

Email: olwethum@ntinga.org.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr X. Jikwana 

Tel: 047 495 0526 

Email: xhantij@ntinga.org.za 

 

30 September 2020 
before at 12h00 
 
BID BOX 
Ntinga OR Tambo 
Development Agency 
SOC LTD, reception 
area. Address: Old 
Government Printers, 
No. 05 Textile Road, 
Southernwood, 
Mthatha, 5099 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
NTINGA O.R. 
TAMBO 
DEVELOPMENT   

310/2020 Service and Maintenance of two (2) Kei Fresh 
Produce Market Ripening Room for the period of 36 
months. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
0 3 September 2020 @11h00 in Mthatha, Kei Fresh 
Produce Market, 32 Errol Spring Avenue, Vulindlela 
Heights. 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Ntinga O.R. Tambo Development Agency Offices, 
Room 08, from 08h00 on 31 August 2020 @ a 
non-refundable deposit of R200.00 per document. . 
However, bidders who previously purchased this 
/ these bid document(s) will get them free of 
charge provided that there is proof of previous 
purchase. 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr O Muteyi 

Tel: 047 495 0528, 

Email: olwethum@ntinga.org.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr X. Jikwana 

Tel: 047 495 0526 

Email: xhantij@ntinga.org.za 

 

30 September 2020 
before at 12h00 
 
BID BOX 
Ntinga OR Tambo 
Development Agency 
SOC LTD, reception 
area. Address: Old 
Government Printers, 
No. 05 Textile Road, 
Southernwood, 
Mthatha, 5099 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
NTINGA O.R. 
TAMBO 
DEVELOPMENT   

311/2020 Supply of Sheep for Livestock Wool Improvement 
Project. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
03 September 2020 @14h00 in Mthatha, 5 Textile 
Road, Vulindlela Heights. 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Ntinga O.R. Tambo Development Agency Offices, 
Room 08, from 08h00 on 31 August 2020 @ a non-
refundable deposit of R200.00 per document. . 
However, bidders who previously purchased this 
/ these bid document(s) will get them free of 
charge provided that there is proof of previous 
purchase. 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr O Muteyi 

Tel: 047 495 0528, 

Email: olwethum@ntinga.org.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr Z. Kanise 

Tel: 047 495 0526, 

Email: zandisilek@ntinga.org.za 

 

17 September 2020 
before at 12h00 
 
BID BOX 
Ntinga OR Tambo 
Development Agency 
SOC LTD, reception 
area. Address: Old 
Government Printers, 
No. 05 Textile Road, 
Southernwood, 
Mthatha, 5099, 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF HEALTH 

SCMU3-20/21-0116-
HO 

Provision of training for learners to be placed in the 
HWSETA funded 12 months learner post basic 
pharmacy assistant programme for a three year 
period 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
The bid briefing session will not be held due to 
stringent COVID-19 pandemic restrictions.          
Bidders who have shown interest in the bid are 
encouraged to submit bid enquiries to the Email 
address provided. 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Supply Chain Management Unit, Department of 
Health, Ground Floor, Global Life Building, Bisho, 
from 08h00 on 31 August 2020 @ a non-refundable 
deposit of R100.00 per document. 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr M Magula  

Email:Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.

za 

 

 

25 September 2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Main Security Gate, 
SCMU, Global Life 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF PUBLIC 
WORKS & 
INFRASTRUCTU
RE 

SCMU5-20/21-0001 
AMR INF 

24 Months Contract for Maintenance of Pumps and 
Generators for Department of Public Works and 
Infrastructure: Amathole Region 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
Due to COVID19 no briefing meeting will be held 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Dept  of Public Works, Corner of Scholl and 
Amalinda Main Road, Amalinda, East London, from 
08h00 on 28 August 2020 @ a non-refundable 
deposit of R100.00 per document OR downloadable 
for free of charge from Department of Public Works 
website (www.ecdpw.gov.za/tenders ) 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr D Magwala 

Tel: 043 711 5798 

Cell: 079 494 0627 

Email:dumisani.magwala@ecdpw.gov

.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Y Yako 

Cell: 082 497 0384 

Email: yonela.yako@ecdpw.gov.za 

 

28 September 2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Department of Public 
Works, Block B 
Building – Reception 
Area,  Corner of 
Scholl and Amalinda 
Main Road, 
Amalinda, East 
London 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
3ME OR HIGHER  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.ecdpw.gov.za/tenders
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mailto:dumisani.magwala@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:yonela.yako@ecdpw.gov.za


Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 20          20/21FY  28 August 2020 

This publication is available on www.ectreasury.gov.za 

19 
 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AGENCY 
(ECRDA) 

SCMU 06 – 2020/21 Appointment of a consultant for the planning and 
development of Elundini Wool Hub for a one-year 
period. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
28 August 2020 on ECRDA website: 
www.ecrda.co.za 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs M Esben 

Tel: 043 703 6300 

Email: esbenm@ecrda.co.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr R Turner 

Tel: 048 881 0177  

Cell: 072 770 1523 

Email: turnerr@ecrda.co.za 

 

18 September 2020 
at 11h00 
 
BID BOX 
All bids must be 
submitted 
electronically to: 
tenders@ecrda.co.za 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-IHC-20/21 
– 006 

Appointment of a Professional Service Provider for 
Repair and Maintenance of Camp Sites.  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
08h00 on 28 August 2020 from Departmental 
Website: www.ectransport.gov.za and E- Tender 
Portal: www.e-tenders.gov.za.  
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs Thandi Mafani 

Cell: 072 690 1534 

Email:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.

za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Ms. N. Funani  

Cell: 066 381 7873 

Email:Noluntu.Funani@ectrasport.gov

.za 

22 September 2020 
@ 11H00 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, 32 Cowen 
Close, Old Building, 
Stellenbosch Park, C 
Block Foyer, King 
Williams Town, 5601 
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.ecrda.co.za/
mailto:esbenm@ecrda.co.za
mailto:turnerr@ecrda.co.za
mailto:tenders@ecrda.co.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-IHC-20/21 
- 007 

Hiring of Small Plant for Structural Work for In-House 
Teams for a period of 36 Months.  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
08h00 on 28 August 2020 from Departmental 
Website: www.ectransport.gov.za and E- Tender 
Portal: www.e-tenders.gov.za.  
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs Thandi Mafani  

Cell: 072 690 1534  

Email:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.

za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Z. Ngala  

Cell: 066 027 7358   

Email:Zukile.Ngala@ectransport.gov.z

a 

22 September 2020 
@ 11H00 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, 32 Cowen 
Close, Old Building, 
Stellenbosch Park, C 
Block Foyer, King 
Williams Town, 5601 
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-IHC-20/21 
- 008 

Supply and Delivery of Laboratory Consumables for 
In-House Teams  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
08h00 on 28 August 2020 from Departmental 
Website: www.ectransport.gov.za and E- Tender 
Portal: www.e-tenders.gov.za.  
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs Thandi Mafani  

Cell: 072 690 1534  

Email:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.

za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Z. Ngala  

Cell: 066 027 7358   

Email:Zukile.Ngala@ectransport.gov.z

a  

22 September 2020 
@ 11H00 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, 32 Cowen 
Close, Old Building, 
Stellenbosch Park, C 
Block Foyer, King 
Williams Town, 5601 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.ectransport.gov.za/
mailto:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.za
mailto:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-IHC- 
20/21-009 

Supply and Delivery of Survey Consumables For In-
House Teams 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
08h00 on 28 August 2020 from Departmental 
Website: www.ectransport.gov.za and E- Tender 
Portal: www.e-tenders.gov.za.  
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs Thandi Mafani  

Cell: 072 690 1534  

Email:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.

za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Z. Ngala  

Cell: 066 027 7358   

Email:Zukile.Ngala@ectransport.gov.z

a  

22 September 2020 
@ 11H00 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, 32 Cowen 
Close, Old Building, 
Stellenbosch Park, C 
Block Foyer, King 
Williams Town, 5601 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-IHC 20/21-
010 

Supply and Delivery of Survey Equipment for In-
House Construction  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
08h00 on 28 August 2020 from Departmental 
Website: www.ectransport.gov.za and E- Tender 
Portal: www.e-tenders.gov.za.  
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs Thandi Mafani  

Cell: 072 690 1534  

Email:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.

za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Z. Ngala  

Cell: 066 027 7358   

Email:Zukile.Ngala@ectransport.gov.z

a  

22 September 2020 
@ 11H00 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, 32 Cowen 
Close, Old Building, 
Stellenbosch Park, C 
Block Foyer, King 
Williams Town, 5601 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.ectransport.gov.za/
mailto:thandi.mafani@dot.ecprov.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 
– GOVERNMENT 
FLEET 
MANAGEMENT 
SERVICES 

SCMU 10-GFMS-
20/21-0003 

Procurement of Computer Equipment for GFMS 
(Department of Transport Government Fleet 
Management Services) Trading Entity. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents will be available for collection at : 
Department of Transport GFMS Trading Entity 
Castellano Building - Reception 
From 08h00-16h00 (Mondays -Thursdays) and 
08h00-15h00 (Fridays) at No. 25 Brooklyn Road, 
Wood Brook, East London from 14th August 2020 
at a non-refundable deposit of R100.00, payable into 
the Department of Transport – GFMS Trading Entity 
bank account number: ECPG Dept of Transport 
Government Fleet Trading Entity, Bank Name: 
Standard Bank, Account Number: 273021834, 
Branch Code: 050419, Branch Name: King 
Williams Town. 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr S.B. Ngceba 

Tel: 043 731 1140 

Cell: 067 429 3371 

Email:siyanda.ngceba@ectransport.g

ov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. B Bam 

Tel: 043 731 1130 

Cell: 071 872 1605 

Email:Bonga.bam@ectransport.gov.z

a 

 

22 September 2020 
at 11H00 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport GFMS 
Trading Entity 
Castellano Building 
- Reception 
No. 25 Brooklyn Road 
Wood Brook 
East London East 
London 
5218 
 
(bids must be 
deposited in a bid 
box situated at 
ground floor at 
reception) 
  
Late, facsimiled, 
scanned bids will not 
be considered for 
evaluation. 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF ECONOMIC 
DEVELOPMENT, 
ENVIRONMENT
AL AFFAIRS 
AND TOURISM 

SCMU- PP09-20/21-
10 

Appointment of a suitable service provider for 
implementary waste management services to the 
inland region (Bhisho/ King Williams Town area)of 
Buffalo City Metropolitan Municipality. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents will be available on the departmental 
website www.dedea.gov.za from the 31 August 
2020 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms Hlokoma Mtshotshisa 

Tel: 043 605 7153 

Cell: 072 045 8528 

Email:Hlokoma.mtshotshisa@dedea.g

ov.za 

Ms Nosidima Tito 

Tel: 043 605 7191 

Cell: 082 959 3893 

Email:Nosidima.Tito@dedea.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mrs. Lulama Daniels  

Email:lulama.daniels @dedea.gov.za/  

 

All technical enquiries must be 

forwarded to the above e-mail.  

 

28 September 2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Dept of Economic 
Development, 
Environmental 
Affairs and Tourism, 
corner of Mc Lean 
and Downing Street, 
Old Standard Bank 
Building, King 
William's Town, 
5600 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
GAMBLING 
BOARD 

ECGB-20/21-BID 01 Provision of a printing solution, rental and 
maintenance of multi-function copiers  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Bid documents with the necessary terms of 
reference, may be obtained from the EC Gambling 
Board website: www.ecgb.org.za as from  
28 August 2020 during working hours only. 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Thandi Malotana 

Tel: 043 7028307 

Email: thandazwam@ecgb.org.za 

 

 

 

21 September 2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Eastern Cape 
Gambling Board, 
Quenera Park, 
Quenera Drive, 
Beacon Bay 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
GAMBLING 
BOARD 

ECGB-20/21-BID 02 Provision of a hosted electronic meeting pack system 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Bid documents with the necessary terms of 
reference, may be obtained from the EC Gambling 
Board website: www.ecgb.org.za as from  
28 August 2020 during working hours only. 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Thandi Malotana 

Tel: 043 7028307 

Email: thandazwam@ecgb.org.za 

 

  

 

21 September 2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Eastern Cape 
Gambling Board, 
Quenera Park, 
Quenera Drive, 
Beacon Bay 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-20/21-
0032 

Construction of concrete side drains for the 
Cofimvaba to Askeaton project for a period of 18 
months. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Bid documents will be available as from Monday 31 
August 2020. Documents must be downloaded on 
www.ectransport.gov.za and/or www.etender 
portal.gov.za 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr. Nqikashe 

Tel: 067 419 8001 

Email:Philasande.Nqikashe@ectransp

ort.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mrs J Asare 

Cell: 073 762 4614 

Email:Juliet.Asare@ectransport.gov.z

a 

 

02 October  2020 at 
11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, C Block 
Foyer, old building, 
32 Cowan Close, 
Stellenbosch Park 
Building, King 
William’s Town, 5601 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
GRADE 6CE (5CE 
PE OR HIGHER) 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF TRANSPORT 

SCMU10-20/21-
0033 

Construction of concrete side drains for the Coffee 
bay to Zithulele project for a period of 12 months.  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Bid documents will be available as from Monday 31 
August 2020 .Documents must be downloaded on 
www.ectransport.gov.za and/or www.etender 
portal.gov.za 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr. Nqikashe 

Tel: 067 419 8001 

Email:Philasande.Nqikashe@ectransp

ort.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr L. Shode 

Tel: 049 892 6131 

Email:luzuko.shode@ectransport.gov.

za 

02 October  2020 at 
11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Department of 
Transport, C Block 
Foyer, old building, 
32 Cowan Close, 
Stellenbosch Park 
Building, King 
William’s Town, 5601 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
GRADE 6CE OR 
5CEPE OR HIGHER 

 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.ectransport.gov.za/
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF PUBLIC 
WORKS & 
INFRASTRUCTU
RE 

SCMU5-20/21-0090 Appointment of service provider for plumbing 
maintenance for prestige houses for the period of 3 
years. 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Tender documents can be downloaded free of 
charge from National Treasury’s eTender Portal:  
http://www.etenders.gov.za/content/advertised-
tenders  or from the Department of Public Works 
website: www.ecdpw.gov.za/tenders from 28 August 
2020. Due to Covid19 Tender documents will not be 
available at the office. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
SPECIAL BID CONDITIONS 

1. The minimum specifications, other bid 
conditions and rules are detailed in the bid 
document under Tender Data  

2. The specifications, rules, special conditions of 
bid, evaluation criteria, and rules for 
evaluation for compliance to local content and 
other bid conditions are detailed in the 
document.  

3. Only locally produced goods or services with 
a stipulated minimum threshold for local 
production and content of 70 % (Designated 
sector: Valves Products & Actuators) will be 
considered.  

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr Z. Billie 

Tel: 040 602 4563/4000 

Cell: 082 885 3425 

Email: zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Q. Keke 

Tel: 040 602 4266 

Email: Qhama.keke@ecdpw.gov.za 

 

01 October 2020 at 
11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
Department of Public 
Works; Qhasana 
Building; Ground 
Floor, Bisho 
 
Due to Covid-19 
safety regulations, no 
prospective bidders 
will be allowed at the 
opening of the tender 
box; register will be 
published on the 
departmental website 
(www.ecdpw.gov.za/t
enders) 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
 
CIDB: 4SO only 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION 

ECDC/ELN/211/082
020 

Provision of Server and Storage Infrastructure 
Upgrade 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
There will be no briefing meeting. 
 
for any enquiries/queries relating to this Bid , Bidders 
are required to email the procurement department at 
tenders@ecdc.co.za, attention S Vanda quoting the 
Bid Number and Description 
 
Answers/Clarity on Bid will be distributed to the list 
that has registered their interest to this bid and 
posted on the website at www.ecdc.co.za  
 
Bidders should send an email to ECDC Procurement 
at tenders@ecdc.co.za to register their interest in 
submitting the bid  
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
ECDC Website:  www.ecdc.co.za from Friday, 28 
August 2020 
 

 

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms S. Vanda 

Tel: 043 704 5600 

Email: tenders@ecdc.co.za 

 

28 September 2020 
at 12:00 pm 
 
BID BOX 
ECDC Head Offices, 
Ocean Terrace Park, 
Moore Street, 
Quigney, East 
London  
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
Accreditation: 
Approved Seller 
and Installer 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION 

ECDC/ELN/239/082
020 

Construction of Informal Trade Infrastructure Phase 1 
at Emaxesibeni (Mount Ayliff) in Mzimvubu Local 
Municipality 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
There will be no briefing meeting. 
 
for any enquiries/queries relating to this Bid , Bidders 
are required to email the procurement department at 
tenders@ecdc.co.za, attention S Vanda quoting the 
Bid Number and Description 
 
Answers/Clarity on Bid will be distributed to the list 
that has registered their interest to this bid and 
posted on the website at www.ecdc.co.za  
 
Bidders should send an email to ECDC Procurement 
at tenders@ecdc.co.za to register their interest in 
submitting the bid  
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
ECDC Website:  www.ecdc.co.za from Friday, 28 
August 2020 
 

 

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms S. Vanda 

Tel: 043 704 5600 

Email: tenders@ecdc.co.za 

 

30th September 2020 
at 12:00 pm 
 
BID BOX 
ECDC Head Offices, 
Ocean Terrace Park, 
Moore Street, 
Quigney, East 
London  
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
Accreditation: 
Valid CIDB Grading 
of 6GB or Higher 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION 

ECDC/ELN/240/082
020 

Upgrading of R63/352 Intersection and Extension of 
R352 as well as the Rehabilitation of Bulk Services to 
Dimbaza Industrial Park 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
There will be no briefing meeting. 
 
for any enquiries/queries relating to this Bid , Bidders 
are required to email the procurement department at 
tenders@ecdc.co.za, attention S Vanda quoting the 
Bid Number and Description 
 
Answers/Clarity on Bid will be distributed to the list 
that has registered their interest to this bid and 
posted on the website at www.ecdc.co.za  
 
Bidders should send an email to ECDC Procurement 
at tenders@ecdc.co.za to register their interest in 
submitting the bid  
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
ECDC Website:  www.ecdc.co.za from Friday, 28 
August 2020 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms S. Vanda 

Tel: 043 704 5600 

Email: tenders@ecdc.co.za 

 

28 September 2020 
at 12:00 pm 
 
BID BOX 
ECDC Head Offices, 
Ocean Terrace Park, 
Moore Street, 
Quigney, East 
London  
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
 
Accreditation: 
Valid CIDB Grading 
of 7CE or Higher 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION 

ECDC/ELN/241/082
020 

Professional Service for Zanyokhwe Central 
Agricultural Co-Operation in Keiskammahoek 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
There will be no briefing meeting. 
 
for any enquiries/queries relating to this Bid , Bidders 
are required to email the procurement department at 
tenders@ecdc.co.za, attention S Vanda quoting the 
Bid Number and Description 
 
Answers/Clarity on Bid will be distributed to the list 
that has registered their interest to this bid and 
posted on the website at www.ecdc.co.za  
 
Bidders should send an email to ECDC Procurement 
at tenders@ecdc.co.za to register their interest in 
submitting the bid  
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
ECDC Website:  www.ecdc.co.za from Friday, 28 
August 2020 
 

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms S. Vanda 

Tel: 043 704 5600 

Email: tenders@ecdc.co.za 

 

21 September 2020 
at 12:00 pm 
 
BID BOX 
ECDC Head Offices, 
Ocean Terrace Park, 
Moore Street, 
Quigney, East 
London  
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
Accreditation: 
Professional 
Registration 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION 

ECDC/ELN/242/082
020 

Leasing of Laptops to ECDC for a period of Thirty-Six 
(36) Months 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
There will be no briefing meeting. 
 
for any enquiries/queries relating to this Bid , Bidders 
are required to email the procurement department at 
tenders@ecdc.co.za, attention S Vanda quoting the 
Bid Number and Description 
 
Answers/Clarity on Bid will be distributed to the list 
that has registered their interest to this bid and 
posted on the website at www.ecdc.co.za  
 
Bidders should send an email to ECDC Procurement 
at tenders@ecdc.co.za to register their interest in 
submitting the bid  
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
ECDC Website:  www.ecdc.co.za from Friday, 28 
August 2020 
 

 

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Ms S. Vanda 

Tel: 043 704 5600 

Email: tenders@ecdc.co.za 

 

21 September 2020 
at 12:00 pm 
 
BID BOX 
ECDC Head Offices, 
Ocean Terrace Park, 
Moore Street, 
Quigney, East 
London  
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM 

SCMU8-20/21-0112 Supply and installation of uninterrupted power supply 
(ups) equipment / services – Dohne, Joe Gqabi, 
Chris Hani, Sarah Baartman, OR Tambo and 
Amathole regional offices. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
All meeting will be virtual and all links are in the 
terms of reference / specifications of the bid 
document; 
 
8 September 2020 @ 10:00 – Dohne 
8 September 2020 @ 12:00 – Amathole 
9 September 2020 @ 10:00 – Chris Hani 
9 September 2020 @ 12:00 – Joe Gqabi 
10 September 2020 @ 10:00 – Sarah Baartman 
10 September 2020 @ 12:00 – OR Tambo 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents are available from; 
 

1. www.etender.gov.za 
2. www.drdra.gov.za 

 

 

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs. R. Bester 

Tel: 040 – 602 6205 

Email: ronel.bester@drdra.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. S. Gajana 

Tel: 040 – 602 5258 

Email:Simphiwe.gajana@drdar.gov.za 

 

 

18 September  2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
DRDAR – SCM  
UIF Building 
(opposite Bhisho 
Renal Clinic) 
Rharhabe Road, 
Bhisho, 5605 
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

 

 

 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.etender.gov.za/
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM 
 

SCMU8-20/21-0113 Supply and delivery of 170 laptops for TARDI 
students and provisioning of data. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents are available from; 
 

1. www.etender.gov.za 
2. www.drdra.gov.za 

 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mrs. R. Bester 

Tel: 040 602 6205 

Email: ronel.bester@drdra.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Dr. N. Ndudane 

Tel: 047 542 3700 

Email:Nandipha.ndudane@drdar.gov.

za 

18 September  2020 
at 11:00 am 
 
BID BOX 
DRDAR – SCM  
UIF Building 
(opposite Bhisho 
Renal Clinic) 
Rharhabe Road, 
Bhisho, 5605 
 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM 

SCMU8-20/21-0133 Supply and delivery of irrigation material and 
equipment at Krila farm near fort Beaufort in the 
Raymond Mhlaba local municipality in the Eastern 
Cape Province. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents are available on the Departmental 
website (www.drdar.gov.za) from 28 August 2020 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Debra McGregor 

Tel: 043 7068771 

Email: debra.mcgregor@drdar.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Harold Ngadlela 

Tel: 0828214104 

Email:mteteleli.ngadlela@drdar.gov.z

a 

 

28 September 2020 
at 11:00 am  
 
BID BOX 
Phillip Frame Road, 
Waverly Park 
Complex, SARS 
Building – 2nd Floor, 
East London 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
LOCAL CONTENT 
Valves products and 
actuators – 70% 
Pumps, medium 
voltage motors and 
associated 
accessories – 70% 
Steel products and 
components for 
Construction – 100% 
Electrical cabling – 
90%  
Plastic pipes – 100% 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.etender.gov.za/
http://www.drdra.gov.za/
mailto:ronel.bester@drdra.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM 

SCMU8-20/21-0089 
 

Desilting of 5 stock water dams at Amahlathi Local 
Municipality of the Amathole District. 
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents are available on the Departmental 
website (www.drdar.gov.za) from 28 August 2020.  

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Debra McGregor 

Tel: 043 7068771 

Email: debra.mcgregor@drdar.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Harold Ngadlela 

Tel: 0828214104 

Email:mteteleli.ngadlela@drdar.gov.z

a 

18 September 2020 
at 11:00 am  
 
BID BOX 
Phillip Frame Road, 
Waverly Park 
Complex, SARS 
Building – 2nd Floor, 
East London 

P/BEE: 80/20 
 
CIDB 3CE  
 

 

DEPARTMENT/ 
INSTITUTION 

BID NUMBER / CRITERIA 
& ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, 
TIME AND VENUE 

 
EASTERN CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF RURAL 
DEVELOPMENT 
AND AGRARIAN 
REFORM 

SCMU8-20/21-0132 Supply and delivery of irrigation material and 
equipment at Craighead Farm near Peddie in 
the Nqgushwa Local Municipality in the 
Eastern Cape Province  
 
COMPULSORY BRIEFING SESSION 
N/A 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT 
Documents are available on the 
Departmental website (www.drdar.gov.za) 
from 28 August 2020   

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Debra McGregor 

Tel: 043 7068771 

Email: debra.mcgregor@drdar.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Harold Ngadlela 

Tel: 0828214104 

Email:mteteleli.ngadlela@drdar.gov.z

a 

28 September 2020 
at 11:00 am  
 
BID BOX 
Phillip Frame Road, 
Waverly Park 
Complex, SARS 
Building – 2nd Floor, 
East London 

P/BEE: 80/20 
SABI REGISTRATION AS 
A COMPANY MEMBER 
 
LOCAL CONTENT 
Valves products and 
actuators – 70% 
Pumps, medium voltage 
motors and associated 
accessories – 70% 
Steel products and 
components for 
Construction – 100% 
Electrical cabling – 90%  
Plastic pipes – 100% 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
http://www.drdar.gov.za/
mailto:mteteleli.ngadlela@drdar.gov.za
mailto:mteteleli.ngadlela@drdar.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

BID NUMBER / 
CRITERIA & 
ACCREDITATION 

PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, TIME 
AND VENUE 

PROVINCIAL 
TREASURY 

SCMU12-20/21-
0003 
 
 
P/BEE: 80/20  
 

Supply and delivery of Office stationery for a period of 
thirty six (36) months for Provincial Treasury Eastern 
Cape with an option to extend for twelve (12) months. 
 
NO BRIEFING SESSION TO BE HELD  
 
 
AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENTS 
 
Department of Provincial Treasury, SCM Unit Shop 
No.7 Corner Phalo & Independence Avenues, 
Tyamzashe Building, Bhisho. 
 
Document will be available on departmental website 
http://www.ectreasury.gov.za on Friday  02 
September 2020 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

  

P. Ndaleni (040)1010122 

 

 

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT 

SPECIFIC  

 

N. Tumana (040)1010 208 

11H00 on the  18th 
September 2020 
 
Bid Box,  
Provincial Treasury 
Supply Chain 
Management Unit 
Shop, No.7 Corner Phalo 
& Independence Avenues 
Tyamzashe Building 
Bhisho 
5605 
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AWARDS 
 
NAME OF INSTITUTION: EASTERN CAPE DEPARTMENT OF SPORT, RECREATION, ARTS AND CULTURE 

TENDER 
BULLETIN NO 

BID NUMBER /  PROJECT DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT POINTS NAME OF BIDDER CONTACT PERSON 

PTB NO.45 19/20 
FY 
 
 

SCMU14-20/21-
0001 
 
 

Appointment of a reputable service 
provider to render office cleaning 
services and washroom services for a 
period of 24 months at Wilton Mkwayi in 
King Williams Town 

R3 212 054.40 
 
 

20 

Virtrim t/a Continental 
Projects 
 
 
 

Ms A. Mbodla  
Tel:043 492 1308 
 
 

PTB NO.45 19/20 
FY 
 

SCMU14-20/21-
0002 
 

Supply, delivery and installation of 
Mpendla modular library at Mount Frere 
in the Eastern Cape province 
 

R2 106 920.75 
 
 

20 
 
 

Kugqitywe 
construction jv Sig 
handlers 
 

Ms A. Mbodla  
Tel:043 492 1308 
 
 

 

 
NAME OF INSTITUTION: ECRDA 

TENDER 
BULLETIN NO 

BID NUMBER /  PROJECT DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT POINTS NAME OF BIDDER CONTACT PERSON 

PTB No. 42 – 
07/02/2020 

SCMU 13 - 
2019/20 

Appointment of a service provider for  
Supply, Delivery And Installation Of 
Solar Powered Drip Irrigation System 
For Tshabo RED HUB Including 
Training 

R 3 001 868.93 80 WM Spilhaus Cradock Mrs M Esben 

PTB No. 44 – 
21/02/2020 
 

SCMU 14 - 
2019/20 

 
Appointment of a service provider for 
the Installation & Setup Of A Multi-
Label Protocol Switched (Mpls) 
Network And Hosted Pbx Telephony 
for the ECRDA Head Office, Regional 
Offices and Branches. 

R 6,997,799.14 100 Brilliant 
Telecommunications 
(Pty) Ltd 

Mrs M Esben 

PTB NO. 10 - 
12/06/2020 

SCMU 02 – 
2020/21 

Appointment of a service provider to  
Facilitate Process Of Organisational 
Realignment And Reconfiguration for 
the ECRDA 

R435 600.00 
 
 
 

90.65 Lekoko Consulting Pty 
Ltd 

Mrs M Esben 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
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NAME OF INSTITUTION: DRDAR 

TENDER 
BULLETIN NO 

BID NUMBER /  PROJECT DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT POINTS NAME OF BIDDER CONTACT PERSON 

TB No.09 20/21 
FY 

05 June 2020 

SCMU8-20/21-
0081 

BID DOCUMENT FOR CONSTRUCTION 
OF A MULTIPURPOSE SHED AT 
RAMATEEE VILLAGE IN THE ELUNDINI 
LOCAL MUNICIPALITY OF THE JOE 
GQABI DISTRICT 

R1 145 981.76 100.00 Mathexo Trading U Mntuyedwa 

TB No.09 20/21 
FY 

05 June 2020 

SCMU8-20/21-
0082 

BID DOCUMENT FOR CONSTRUCTION 
OF A MULTIPURPOSE SHED AT 
RHODES                                          
COMMONAGE IN THE SENQU LOCAL 
MUNICIPALITY OF THE JOE GQABI 
DISTRICT 

R979 722.65 100.00 MYTY Hands Pty Ltd S Baloyi 

TB No.09 20/21 
FY 

05 June 2020 

SCMU8-20/21-
0083 

BID DOCUMENT FOR CONSTRUCTION 
OF A MULTIPURPOSE SHED AT                                   
RIETFONTEIN VILLAGE IN THE SENQU 
LOCAL MUNICIPALITY OF THE JOE 
GQABI DISTRICT 

R970 416.31 100.00 MYTY Hands Pty Ltd S Baloyi 

TB No.09 20/21 
FY 

05 June 2020 

SCMU8-20/21-
0084 

BID DOCUMENT FOR CONSTRUCTION 
OF A MULTIPURPOSE SHED AT             
ESILINDINI VILLAGE IN THE SENQU 
LOCAL MUNICIPALITY OF THE JOE 
GQABI DISTRICT 

R906 792.65 100.00 Rekhonne Trading 
and Construction 

K Siqana 

TB No.09 20/21 
FY 

05 June 2020 

SCMU8-20/21-
0085 

BID DOCUMENT FOR CONSTRUCTION 
OF A MULTIPURPOSE STORAGE SHED                                    
AT THE WS CUSTOM FEEDLOT IN THE 
WALTER SISULU LOCAL MUNICIPALITY 
OF THE JOE GQABI DISTRICT 

R977 279.25 100.00 Abecord Group W Mdwaba 
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PROVINCIAL TREASURY: EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD 
 

BIDDERS ARE HEREBY NOTIFIED THAT THE PROVINCIAL TREASURY ENCOUNTERED CHALLENGES BEYOND THE DEPARTMENT’S 

CONTROL AND COULD NOT AWARD THE BELOW MENTIONED BIDS WITHIN THE 90 DAY VALIDITY PERIOD. THE DEPARTMENT IS 

CURRENTLY SENDING OUT LETTERS REQUESTING EXTENSION OF VALIDITY PERIOD TO ALL BIDDERS THAT HAVE SUBMITTED THEIR 

BID OFFERS. BIDDERS ARE REQUESTED TO BE ALERT FOR COMMUNICATION FROM THE DEPARTMENT. 

 

Manufacture, Supply And Delivery Of Personal Protective Equipment For Covid-19 Emergency and Future Procurement to the Eastern 

Cape Provincial Government for a period of twenty-four months (24) for these commodities: 

BID EXTENDED VALIDITY PERIOD 

SCMO-20/21-003 – General 

Purposes 

18 November 2020 

SCMO-20/21-002 – Plastics and 

Chemicals 

21 November 2020 

SCMO-20/21-001 - Textile  24 November 2020 

 

THE DEPARTMENT IS ISSUING LETTERS TO ALL BIDDERS AND RESPONSES MUST BE EMAILED BACK 
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CANCELATION 
DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO  
BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  

CONTACT PERSON 

 
EASTERN 
CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF HUMAN 
SETTLEMENTS 

 SCMU11-19/20-004 - Gcinisa 500 housing project: Appointment of a turnkey 

contractor for construction of 500 new units and 500 services (VIP toilets & 

water tanks) in Gcinisa village at Ngqushwa municipality 

  
REASONS FOR CANCELLATION 
The bid validity period has expired. 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr X. Mpupa 

Cell:0741424781 

Tell:043 711 9874 

E-mail:XolileM@ecdhs.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES 

Mr P. Bester 

Cell: 0794936350 

E-mail:PetrusB@ecdhs.gov.za 

EASTERN 
CAPE 
DEPARTMENT 
OF HUMAN 
SETTLEMENTS 

 SCMU11-19/20-006 - Silver City 999 informal upgrading project: Appointment of 
a professional service provider (PSP) to conduct inception, design & planning, 
contract administration and construction monitoring of 360 units 
  
REASONS FOR CANCELLATION 
The bid validity period has expired. 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr X. Mpupa 

Cell:0741424781 

Tell:043 711 9874 

E-mail:XolileM@ecdhs.gov.za 

 

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES 

Mr. Z. Beja 

Cell: 074 142 6448 

Tell: 039 727 3337 

Email: ZibeleB@ecdhs.gov.za 
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO  
BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  

CONTACT PERSON 

NTINGA O.R. 
TAMBO 
DEVELOPMEN
T AGENCY  

PTB NO.45 19/20 
FY 

306/2020 - Service and Maintenance of four (4) Kei Fresh Produce Market 
Cold Room for the period of 36 months. 
 
REASONS FOR CANCELLATION 
Budget Constraints 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr. O. Muteyi on 047 531 0346, 

email:  olwethum@ntinga.org.za  

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. X. Jikwana on 047 495 0526, 

email:  xhant i j@nt inga.org.za  

NTINGA O.R. 
TAMBO 
DEVELOPMEN
T AGENCY 

PTB NO.45 19/20 
FY 

307/2020- Service and Maintenance of two (2) Kei Fresh Produce Market 
Ripening Room for the period of 36 months. 
 
REASONS FOR CANCELLATION 
Budget Constraints 
  
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr. O. Muteyi on 047 531 0346, 

email:  olwethum@ntinga.org.za  

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. X. Jikwana on 047 495 0526, 

email:  xhant i j@nt inga.org.za  

NTINGA O.R. 
TAMBO 
DEVELOPMEN
T AGENCY 

PTB NO.45 19/20 
FY 

308/2020- Supply of Sheep for Livestock Wool Improvement Project. 
 
REASONS FOR CANCELLATION 
Budget Constraints 
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

Mr. O. Muteyi on 047 531 0346, 

email:  olwethum@ntinga.org.za  

 

TECHNICAL/PROJECT SPECIFIC  

Mr. Z. Kanise on 047 495 0541, 
email:  zandisi lek@ntinga.org.za  

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
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DEPARTMENT/ 
INSITUTION 

PTB NO  
BID NUMBER  &  PROJECT DESCRIPTION  

CONTACT PERSON 

 
COEGA 
DEVELOPMENT 
CORPORATION 
(PTY) LTD 

 
PTB NO.45  

CDC/04/20: KSD TVET College maintenance programme: maintenance to Mngazi 
Campus and external works. 
 
REASONS FOR CANCELLATION 
The scope of work has changed materially from what was advertised initially.   
 

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 

AND TECHNICAL/PROJECT 

SPECIFIC  

Ms. Zine Mtanda: 

tenders@coega.co.za   

Acting Unit Head: Supply 

Chain Management; 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
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                                                     PROVINCIAL TREASURY 
 
 

The Eastern Cape Provincial Treasury urges all suppliers, who have not as yet registered on the 
National Treasury Central Supplier Database (CSD) to do so as a matter of urgency. The CSD is 
a self-registration process, which can be completed online at www.csd.gov.za.  
 
Contracted suppliers will not be able to receive orders or payments unless registered on the CSD. 
 
Suppliers are encouraged to check their banking details verification after registering on the CSD 
and ensure that the banking details are appearing on the CSD report as validated.  
 
Suppliers are similarly encouraged to register and/or update their information on CSD. 
 
Suppliers are welcome to visit the Provincial Treasury Helpdesk for assistance with registration, 
especially those that do not have access to a computer and/or internet.  
 
 
 
 
Enquiries must be directed to: 

Xoliswa Mzimkulu at    040 1010 421; xoliswa.mzimkulu@ectreasury.gov.za; 

Abongile Makala at       040 1010 571; abongile.makala@ectreasury.gov.za 

Khanyiso Nqinileyo at    040 1010 407; khanyiso.nqinileyo@ectreasury.gov.za 
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QUICK REFERENCE USER GUIDE 
CENTRALISED SUPPLIERS DATABASE (CSD) 

 
INTRODUCTION 
 
This guide serves to assist users of the new Centralized Suppliers Database (CSD). By 
following the steps in this quick reference guide access to the CSD and registration of 
suppliers will be possible. 
 
STEP 1 

 Prospective users will have register as users on the CSD website and follow the 
following actions; 

1. Enter www.csd.gov.za in web browser  

 The user is navigated to the CSD Home Page 

2. Click on Register on the menu bar on the CSD Home Page 

3. Enter your: 

 E-mail address  

 Name  

 Surname  

 Cellphone number 

4. Select an identification type in the identification type dropdown 

5. Enter identification number  

   If a foreign passport number or foreign ID number is entered then a work permit number 
must also be entered 

6. Enter a password 

  A password must contain a minimum of 8 characters and include a capital letter, a lower 
case letter, a number  

        and a special character 

7. Confirm password 

8. Select and complete 3 security questions  

9. Check the I am not a robot Captcha 

10. Check the I accept the terms and conditions 

11. Click on the Register button 

 The following message will be displayed: ‘Thank you for registering. An account 
activation e-mail has been 

  Sent to you’.  In order for you to use your account, you will have to click the link in the 
e-mail to activate your account. 

 

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
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 The account then needs to be activated. Please follow the following steps; 
 

1. Open the CSD activation e-mail and click on the Activate Account link 

  A One Time Pin (OTP) is sent as an SMS to the cellphone number provided on the 
registration screen 

2. Enter the OTP in the Account Activation screen 

3. Click on the Submit button 

 The following message will be displayed:  Account activated.   

 The message will have a Log In link   

STEP 2 
 

 Once the account has been activated then suppliers can start to be captured onto the 
CSD. 

 By going to add supplier and clicking on each tab, supplier information is captured onto 
the CSD by category. 

 Information entered is verified automatically through National Treasury, via the CSD 
linkages to various organizations. 

 The last tab, Overview, gives detail on the progress of the application. Use it to 
reference if any information has been omitted. 

 Once no outstanding tasks are flagged in the Overview, the application can be 
submitted by clicking SUBMIT. 

 The supplier number and security code will then be generated for the supplier. Both are 
extremely important and need to be recorded for safekeeping. 

 The supplier is now registered on the CSD. 
 

  
STEP 3 
 
CONTINUED USE OF THE CSD 
Should you at any time require any assistance with the CSD, please contact (012) 406 
9222 or csd@treasury.gov.za or abongile.makala@ectreasury.gov.za or by 040 1010 
571. 

 
 
 

 
 

 

 

  

http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:csd@treasury.gov.za
mailto:abongile.makala@ectreasury.gov.za

