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NOTICE TO ALL SUPPLIERS!

Suppliers need to be aware of the phishing scams!
“National Treasury will NEVER ask you to click on a link to provide your CSD

username and password. Please be vigilant when online.”

SUPPLIERS MUST ALSO NOTE:

e More details of the bid notices and conditions are available on E-portal
on this website:
www.e-tenders.gov.za / ADVERTISED
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ATTENTION TO ALL SUPPLIERS

It has come to our attention that there are small businesses and co-operatives in the Province who are
manufacturing and supplying cloth masks but are not registered with the Department of Small Business
as per the requirement of Paragraph 4.6 (d) of the National Treasury Instruction Note No. 05 of 2020/2021

and as such do not appear on the list accessible from the link.

You are kindly requested to take note of the attached REQUEST FOR INFORMATION and small

businesses and co-operatives are encouraged to register as advertised.

In addition, you can email Mr Kgolane Thulare from the Department of Small Business with requests on
behalf of small businesses and co-operatives for inclusion in the list. Please note that the closing date
for registration has been moved to the end as per the email from Mr Fani from the Office of the Chief

Procurement Office within National Treasury.

Mr Thulare’s email address is: KThulare@dsbd.gov.za.

Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 14 21/22FY 02 July 2021

This publication is available on www.ectreasury.qov.za
5



http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:KThulare@dsbd.gov.za

ERRATUM

DEPARTMENT PTB BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON
NO
EASTERN CAPE PTB SCMU5-21/22-0007 - Repairs, renovations and maintenance works at Nelson Mandela SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES
DEPARTMENT OF | NO. 10 | academic hospital in OR Tambo district. Mr. Z. Billie
PUBLIC WORKS & | 21/22 - — —— Tel No: 040-602 4563 / 4000
No. What tl t Errat ) .
INFRASTRUCTURE R v airathsd Indicated in bid | Erratum Cell No: 082 885 3425 during office
1. Contractors must commit to sub- Contractors must commit to sub-contract a E?#;ﬁ Address:
contract a minimum of 30% of work | minimum of 30% of work (value) to Sub- Samuxolo biIIie'@ecd W.0OV.Za
(value) to Sub-contractors who are | contractors who are EME’s or QSE’s which ' DW.GOV.
EME’s or QSE’s which are either are either 51% or 100% Black Owned and
51% or 100% Black Owned and based in the Eastern Cape Province. Tenders ;\r/lEsCIHAl\\Illzcl\A/l\t IIE;\lW%UIRIES
based in the Eastern Cape that do not meet this prequalification criteria TeI. N.o: 047 5u05 2756/047 504 2744
Province. Tenders that do not meet | will be an unacceptable tender. A listing of /073 2.82 3252
this prequalification criterion will be | approved sub-contractors (All Regions) to Email Add )
an unacceptable tender. A listing select from is attached in the tender Inmtﬂi Mb rlejvs.@ dow.aov.za /
of approved sub-contractors (All | document. In addition to the list, local xo?eIV\}a Sillji: ;@eec% ?N 'qoti/ .zaa
Regions) to select from is sub-contractors from the area where -SHNg PW.GOV.
attached in the tender document. | work/services are required will be
accepted.
DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO CONTACT PERSON
INSTITUTION BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION
Expression of interest for updating the catalytic commercialisation of BlackAgro | SCM & TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES
EASTERN CAPE PTB NO. 10 of Enterprise Database. Enquires: Ms N Mfunda
DEPARTMENT OF | 21/22 FY Tel No.: 040 602 5205
RURAL REASONS FQR ERRATUM _ _ Email Address:
DEVELOPMENT Erratum 1: No | What is currently written in the Erratum nomapha.mfunda@drdar.qov.za
AND AGRARIAN PTB No.12 of application document ) =
REFORM 21/22 EY ot ;
1 Pg. 10 of the application: ;’Q:(r:iésdrgg ﬁ;r;nexure 1 TECHNICAL ENOUIRIES
. o Enquires: Mr M Mbangcolo
Nol: Application Documents application document i
. . Tel No.: 079 528 4347
Proposals must be submitted on the | therefore Annexure 1 is Email Address:
application template annexed to these | not applicable to this I AC b ' lo@drd
guidelines(Annexure 1) Expression of Interest | Mongezi.mbangcolo@drdar.gov.za

Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 14

21/22FY

This publication is available on www.ectreasury.qov.za

6

02 July 2021



http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:Inathi.Mbulawa@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:xolelwa.silinga@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:nomapha.mfunda@drdar.gov.za

DEPARTMENT/

PTB NO

CONTACT PERSON

INSTITUTION BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION

EASTERN CAPE SCMUB8-21/22-0055: Design, Supply and installation of two aquaponics SCM & TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES

DEPARTMENT OF PTB NO. 13 21/22 | systems on a turnkey basis in Beyers Naude LM in Sarah Baartman District Enquires: Mr Z Mooi / Mr

SE\F;éII:OPMENT o REASONS FOR ERRATUM Rautenbach

AND AGRARIAN On functionality: Tenderers must score a minimum of 50 points and not 70 points Tel No.: 066476 4195/ 083 447

REFORM . 1513

as previously stated. Email Address:

Zongezile.Mooi@drdar.gov.za/
Skillie.Rautenbach@drdar.gov.za

DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON

INSTITUTION

EASTERN CAPE PTB SCMU5-21/22-0045 - Bid request proposals for the appointment of SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES

DEPARTMENT OF NO.13 service provider to develop and implement an electronic document Enquires: Mr Zamuxolo Billie

PUBLIC WORKS &
INFRASTRUCTURE

management system for a period of three years.

REASON FOR ERRATUM

A non-compulsory briefing meeting will be held on the 06th July 2021 at
11h00 virtually on the following on Microsoft Teams as per the details
below:

Microsoft Teams meeting

Join on your computer or mobile app

Click here to join the meeting

Or call in (audio only)

+27 21 834 0889,,850868963# South Africa, Cape Town

Phone Conference ID: 850 868 963#

Find a local number | Reset PIN

Learn More

Tel No: 040 602 4563

Cell No: 082 885 3425 during office hours
Email Address:
Zamuxolo.Billie@ecdpw.gov.za .

TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES

Enquires: Mr Ndumiso Ntabeni

Tell no: 040 602 4652

Cell No: 071 609 4843 during office hours
Email Address:

ndumiso.ntabeni@ecdpw.gov.za
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DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON
INSTITUTION
CDC/199/21 - Appointment of an accredited service provider to SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES
COEGA PTB NO. 12 conduct 1ISO 20000 and ISO 27000 standards audits for COEGA Enquires: Ms. Zine Mtanda
DEVELOPMENT 2021/22 FY development corporation. Email Address: tenders@coega.co.za
CORPORATION Acting Unit Head: Supply Chain Management;
(PTY)LTD REASONS FOR ERRATUM
The erratum aims to extend the tender closing date for the tender
advert that was advertised on Friday, 18 June 2021. The closing date
has been changed from 12 July 2021 to 13 July 2021 at 12:00.
Everything else in the previous advertisement remains unchanged.
DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO | BID NUMBER & BID DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON
INSTITUTION
EASTERN CAPE PTB SCMUS5-21/22-0007 - Repairs, renovations and maintenance works at Nelson Mandela | SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES
DEPARTMENT OF | NO. academic hospital in OR Tambo district. Mr. Z. Billie
PUBLIC WORKS & | 21/22-12 Tel No: 040-602 4563 / 4000
INFRASTRUCTURE No. | Whatis currently indicated in bid Erratum Cell No: 082 885 3425 during office hours
document Email Address:
1. A compulsory site-briefing meeting will | A Non-compulsory site-briefing zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za

be held on the 29 June 2021 at 10HO0
— 11HO00 on site, Nelson

Mandela Academic Hospital, co-
ordinates: 31°35'15"S 28°45'51"E

meeting will be held on the 29 June
2021 at 10HO0 — 11HOO on site,
Nelson

Mandela Academic Hospital, co-
ordinates: 31°35'15"S 28°45'51"E

This is due to the introduction of
Lockdown COVID 19 Level 4 and its
new adjusted regulations

TECHNICAL ENQUIRIES Ms. |LA.E
Mbulawa

Tel No: 047 505 2756/047 504 2744 / 073
282 3252

Email Address:
Inathi.Mbulawa@ecdpw.gov.za /
xolelwa.silinga@ecdpw.gov.za

Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 14

21/22FY

This publication is available on www.ectreasury.qov.za

8

02 July 2021



http://www.ectreasury.gov.za/
mailto:tenders@coega.co.za
mailto:zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:Inathi.Mbulawa@ecdpw.gov.za
mailto:xolelwa.silinga@ecdpw.gov.za

BID NOTICES

DEPARTMENT/
INSTITUTION

BID NUMBER /
CRITERIA &
ACCREDITATION

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

CONTACT PERSON

CLOSING DATE, TIME
AND VENUE

EASTERN CAPE
DEPARTMENT OF
RURAL
DEVELOPMENT
AND AGRARIAN
REFORM

SCMUS - 21/22 -
0118

P/BBBEE: 80/20
South African
Irrigation Institute
(SABI) certificates

LOCAL CONTENT

Design, supply and installation of a centre pivot at
Shiloh irrigation scheme on a turnkey basis, in the
Chris Hani district.

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION
Click here to join the meeting
Please note: Click control + Click to follow link

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

Steel Products and
Components 100%
Valves 70%
Pumps 70%
Electrical cabling
70%

Electric motor 70%
Plastic pipes 100%

Documents will be available as from 02 July 2021,
can be downloaded free of charge from the
Departmental website (www.drdar.gov.za) or
https://etenders.treasury.gov.za/ and can be
emailed to the supplier on request.

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES
Enquires: Ms N. Mgugwana

Tell no: 045 807 7007/073 434
6177

Email Address:
nokude.mqugwana@drdar.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
Enquires: Mr. B.A. Muir
Tell no: 083 440 0613
Email Address:
bmuir729@gmail.com

02 August 2021 at 11h00

BID BOX:

DRDAR Office, Block H ,
Komani Office Park,
Queenstown, 5320
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DEPARTMENT/
INSTITUTION

BID NUMBER /
CRITERIA &
ACCREDITATION

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

CONTACT PERSON

CLOSING DATE, TIME
AND VENUE

EASTERN CAPE
DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC WORKS &
INFRASTRUCTUR
E

SCMU5-21/22-
0089

P/BBBEE: 80/20

Bid for the appointment of service provider for
datacentre san including maintenance and support
for 36 months as per specification.

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

Tender documents can be downloaded free of
charge from National Treasury’s eTender Portal:
http://www.etenders.gov.za/content/advertised-
tenders or from the Department of Public Works
website: www.ecdpw.gov.za/tenders from 02 July
2021. Due to Covid19, tender documents will not be
available at the office.

NON-COMPUL SORY BRIEFING SESSION

A non-compulsory pre-tender briefing meeting will
be held on the 14th July 2021 at 10h00 virtually on
the following link and prospective tenderers are
required to attend this briefing meeting.

Microsoft Teams meeting

Join on your computer or mobile app

Click here to join the meeting

Or call in (audio only)

+27 21 834 0889,,81204096# South Africa, Cape
Town

Phone Conference ID: 812 040 96#

Find a local number | Reset PIN

Learn More | Meeting options

SPECIAL BID CONDITIONS

1. The Department intends to award this to the
highest point scorer as whole, unless
circumstances justifies otherwise.

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES
Enquires: Mr Z. Billie

Tell No.: 040 602 4563/4000
Cell No.: 082 885 3425 during
office hours

Email Address:
zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENOQUIRES
Enquires: Mr Sydney Prince

Tell No: 040 602 4271

Cell No:082 688 8675 during office
hours

Email Address:
sydney.prince@ecdpw.gov.za

03 August 2021 at 11h00

BID BOX:

Department of Public Works
& Infrastucture; Qhasana
Building; Ground Floor,
Bisho
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Only SITA Accredited Service Providers on
SITA Contract 1183 and SITA Contract 2003
from the Eastern Cape Province are invited to
respond or in the event you are not on SITA
contract provide proof.

Joint ventures are welcome i.e. a company on
SITA contract 1183 can joint venture with a
company on SITA contract 2003 from the
Eastern Cape

The bid will be valid for a period of 120 days
after the closing date.

DEPARTMENT/ BID NUMBER / PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, TIME
INSTITUTION CRITERIA & AND VENUE
ACCREDITATION
CDC/212/21 The acquisition of a research and technology SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 28 July 2021 at 12h00
COEGA partner to achieve the integration, redesign, Enquires: Ms Zine Mtanda
DEVELOPMENT P/BBBEE: 80/20 completion and functionality of the COEGA HCS Email Address: BID BOX:
CORPORATION labour management systems. tenders@coega.co.za CDC main office Coega
(PTY)LTD Business Centre, Cnr

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION

A virtual non-compulsory briefing meeting will be
held on 08 July 2021 at 14h00. Click here to join
the meeting.

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

RFP documents can be downloaded from the CDC
website: www.coega.com from 12h00 on 02 July
2021.

For more details on the advert, please visit the
Coega website (www.coega.com) under current
tenders.

Alcyon Rd and Zibuko
Street, Zone 1, Coega SEZ,
Port Elizabeth
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DEPARTMENT/ BID NUMBER / PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, TIME
INSTITUTION CRITERIA & AND VENUE
ACCREDITATION
SCMU 10-GFMS- Provision of hygiene and cleaning services for SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 26 July 2021 at 11h00
EASTERN CAPE 21/22-0002 government fleet management services trading Enquires: Ms P. Solwandle

DEPARTMENT OF
TRANSPORT -
GOVERNMENT
FLEET
MANAGEMENT
SERVICES

P/BBBEE: 80/20

entity for a period of thirty-six (36) months at the
Port Elizabeth government garage at No.2 York
Road, North End Port Elizabeth (Ggeberha)

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION

No briefing session will be held for this bid.
Enquiries relating to this bid should be made in
writing to phila.solwandle @ectransport.gov.za or
philasolwandle@gmail.com. The closing date for all
enquiries is Monday, 12 July 2021.

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

Bids documents can be downloaded from the
Department of Transport website
www.ectransport.gov.za (Procurement/bid notices)
from the 2" of July 2021 and from eTender Portal
Publication website, www.etenders.gov.za.

Tell no: 060 989 4596
Email Address:
phila.solwandle @ectransport.qov.z

a

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
Enquires: Ms P. Mbewu

Tell no: 079 528 5871

Email Address:
pinkie.mbewu@ectransport.gov.za

BID BOX:

Department of Transport
GFMS Trading Entity
Castellano Building -
Reception

No. 25 Brooklyn Road
Wood Brook

East London East London
5218

(bids must be deposited
in a bid box situated at
ground floor at reception)

Late, facsimiled, scanned
bids will not be considered
for evaluation.
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DEPARTMENT/
INSTITUTION

BID NUMBER /
CRITERIA &
ACCREDITATION

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

CONTACT PERSON

CLOSING DATE, TIME
AND VENUE

EASTERN CAPE
DEPARTMENT OF
HUMAN
SETTLEMENTS

SCMU11-21/22-
003

P/BBBEE: 80/20

The appointment of panel of conveyancers to assist
the Eastern Cape Department of Human
Settlements in the transfer of pre-2014 and post-
2014 houses to qualifying beneficiaries in the
Eastern Cape municipalities.

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION
N/A

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT
The bid documents which will be available from 02

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES

Enquires: Mr Xollile Mpupa
Tell no: 043 711 9874

Cell No: 0741424781
Email Address:
XolileM@ecdhs.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
Enquires: Mrs T.Motolwana
Cell No: 0716896060
Email Address:

25 July 2021 at 11h00

BID BOX:

Department of Human
Settlements, Ground Floor
(at the entrance), 31-33
Phillip Frame Road,
Waverly park, Chiselhurst,
East London.

July 2021 at the offices of Supply Chain ThobekaM@ecdhs.gov.za
Management, First floor, Room 8, Steve Tshwete
House, 31-33 Phillip Frame Road, Waverly Park,
Chiselhurst, East London.
Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 14 21/22FY 02 July 2021
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DEPARTMENT/ BID NUMBER / PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, TIME
INSTITUTION CRITERIA & AND VENUE
ACCREDITATION
SCMU3-21/22- Request for provision of Artisan Training SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 30 July 2021 at 11h00
EASTERN CAPE 0096-HO Learnership Programme for maintenance and Enquires: Mr M Magula

DEPARTMENT OF
HEALTH

P/BBBEE: 80/20

repair services to institution’s infrastructure for a
period of 36 months.

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION

The briefing session shall not be held due to
COVID-19 restrictions. However, bidders are
encouraged to submit written queries regarding the
bid and send them through to the following email
address: Mzwandile.pinca@echealth.gov.za or
Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.za

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

Supply Chain Management Unit, Department of
Health, Ground Floor, Global Life Building, Bisho,
from 08h00 on the 5" July 2021 @ a non-
refundable deposit of R100.00 per document or
download bid document: www.echealth.gov.za

Tell no: 0605579601/0719780415
Email Address:
Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
Enquires: Mzwandile pinca

Tell no: 083 378 9732

Email Address:
Mzwandile.pinca@echealth.gov.za

BID BOX:

Main Security Gate, SCMU,
Global Life

Bisho

5605
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DEPARTMENT/ BID NUMBER / PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, TIME
INSTITUTION CRITERIA & AND VENUE
ACCREDITATION
SCMU3-21/22- Request for provision of training for cleaning, SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 02 August 2021 at 11h00
EASTERN CAPE 0114-HO hygiene and disinfectant of the health environment | Enquires: Mr M Magula

DEPARTMENT OF
HEALTH

P/BBBEE: 80/20

surfaces in the context of COVID-19 for a period of
36 months.

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION

The briefing session shall not be held due to
COVID-19 restrictions. However, bidders are
encouraged to submit written queries regarding the
bid and send them through to the following email
address: Mzwandile.pinca@echealth.gov.za or
Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.za

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

Supply Chain Management Unit, Department of
Health, Ground Floor, Global Life Building, Bisho,
from 08h00 on the 5" July 2021 @ a non-
refundable deposit of R100.00 per document or
download bid document: www.echealth.gov.za

Tell no: 0605579601/0719780415
Email Address:
Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
Enquires: Mzwandile pinca

Tell no: 083 378 9732

Email Address:
Mzwandile.pinca@echealth.gov.za

BID BOX:

Main Security Gate, SCMU,
Global Life

Bisho

5605
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DEPARTMENT/ BID NUMBER / PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON CLOSING DATE, TIME
INSTITUTION CRITERIA & AND VENUE
ACCREDITATION
SCMU3-21/22- Request for provision of control and restraint SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES 02 August 2021 at 11h00
EASTERN CAPE 0033-HO training for mental healthcare workforce in health Enquires: Mr M Magula

DEPARTMENT OF
HEALTH

P/BBBEE: 80/20

facilities for a period of 36 months on a rate-based
contract.

VIRTUAL BRIEFING SESSION

The briefing session shall not be held due to
COVID-19 restrictions. However, bidders are
encouraged to submit written queries regarding the
bid and send them through to the following email
address: Mzwandile.pinca@echealth.gov.za or
Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.za

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENT

Supply Chain Management Unit, Department of
Health, Ground Floor, Global Life Building, Bisho,
from 08h00 on the 5" July 2021 @ a non-
refundable deposit of R100.00 per document or
download bid document: www.echealth.gov.za

Tell no: 0605579601/0719780415
Email Address:
Mzuhleli.magula@echealth.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
Enquires: Mzwandile pinca

Tell no: 083 378 9732

Email Address:
Mzwandile.pinca@echealth.gov.za

BID BOX:
Main Security Gate, SCMU,
Global Life
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AWARDS

NAME OF INSTITUTION: EASTERN CAPE DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS & INFRASTRUCTURE

TENDER BID NUMBER / PROJECT DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT POINTS | NAME OF BIDDER CONTACT PERSON
BULLETIN NO
PTB NO. 26 of SCMU5-20/21- Servicing, maintenance of air R 2244 751.24 100.00 | Bay cool refrigeration | S. Magopeni -
2020/2021 FY 0120 conditioning units to DPWI buildings in | (Incl of Vat) cc 040 602 4086
Chris Hani for a period of 24 months to
various department.
PTB No.19 of SCMU5-20/21- Bid for appointment of Service R 31 788 508.52 87.35 Bulcof Security and S. Magopeni -
2020/2021 0083 Providers to provide security services | (Incl of Vat) Cleaning 040 602 4086
for Health and Safety Cluster one for a
period of 36 Months
PTB No.19 of SCMU5-20/21- Bid for appointment of service R 28 844 354.96 100.00 | Xhobani Security S. Magopeni -
2020/2021 0086 providers to provide security services | (Incl of Vat) Services 040 602 4086
for OTP Cluster for a period of 36
months
PTB 29 of SCMU5-20/21- Tyamzashe Building: Upgrade Water R24 663 812.32 100.00 | Odwa & Solie Trading | S. Magopeni -
2020/2021 0116 Reticulation System, Sewerage (Incl of Vat) Enterprise 040 602 4086

System and Structural Repairs, Head
Office

NAME OF INSTITUTION: EASTERN CAPE DEPARTMENT OF RURAL DEVELOPMENT AGRARIAN REFORM

TENDER BID NUMBER PROJECT DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT POINTS NAME OF CONTACT PERSON
BULLETIN NO BIDDER
PTB NO.04 21/22 | SCMUS8-21/22- Supply, delivery and construction of two | R 818 974.75 99.72 Khanyisa Civil T Cushe
FY 0001 stock water systems in Walter Sisulu Building and
LM, Joe Gqabi district. Electrical
Projects
Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 14 21/22FY 02 July 2021
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NAME OF INSTITUTION: EASTERN CAPE PROVINCIAL TREASURY
TENDER BID NUMBER PROJECT DESCRIPTION BID AMOUNT POINTS NAME OF CONTACT PERSON
BULLETIN NO BIDDER
PTB NO. 44 SCMU12-20/21- Appointment of a service provider to R863,765.00 100 The Talent Hub | 1.S. L. London
0013 conduct a senior leadership International 2. L. Cillie
enhancement and advancement (Pty) Ltd
program in the Eastern Cape Provincial
Treasury (ECPT) for a period of ten
(10) Months
PTB NO. 44 SCMU12-20/21- Appointment of a service provider to R734,652.30 100 Chrom 1.T. Mokoena
0012 review the Department Organizational Consulting (Pty) | 2. Dr.N.Julius
Structure for Eastern Cape Provincial Ltd
Treasury (ECPT) for a period of three
(3) months
CANCELLATION
DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON
INSTITUTION

OFFICE OF THE
PREMIER

PTB NO. 01 21/22
FY

SCMUL1 - 21/22 -0001: Appointment of a service provider to conduct
a design and implementation evaluation research of the integrated

SMME development for a period of six months.

SCMU1-21/22- 0002: Appointment of a service provider to conduct a
design and implementation evaluation research of youth development

for a period of six months.

REASONS FOR CANCELLATION
Non-compliance with Mandatory requirements.

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES

Enquires: Vuyo Nkonki

Tel No.: 067 429 1519

Email Address: Vuyo.Nkonki@ecotp.gov.za
Enquires: Ms Batandwa Nginase

Tel No: 076 783 6993

Email Address:

Batandwa.Nginase @ecotp.gov.za
TECHNICAL ENQUIRES

Enquires: Mr Zuko Mbele

Email Address: Zuko.mbele@ecotp.gov.za

Eastern Cape Provincial Tender Bulletin No. 14
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DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON
INSTITUTION
SCMUB8-21/22-0061: Design, supply and installation of a centre SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES

EASTERN CAPE PTB NO. NO 04 pivot at Shiloh irrigation scheme on a turnkey basis in the Chris Enquires: Ms N.Mgugwana
DEPARTMENT OF | 21/22 FY Hani district. Tel No.: 045 807 7007/073 434 6177
RURAL Email Address: nokude.mgugwana@drdar.gov.za
DEVELOPMENT REASONS FOR CANCELLATION
AND AGRARIAN Non-responsive bid. TECHNICAL ENQUIRES
REFORM Enquires: Brendon Muir

Tel No.: 083 440 0613

Email Address: bmuir729@gmail.com
DEPARTMENT/ PTB NO BID NUMBER & PROJECT DESCRIPTION CONTACT PERSON
INSTITUTION

EASTERN CAPE
DEPARTMENT OF
PUBLIC WORKS &
INFRASTRUCTUR
E

PTB NO. 13 21/22
FY

SCMU5-21/22-0046
Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding

and protection services to properties occupied by the state for Bhisho

cluster two (2) for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0047

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for Sarah
Baartman cluster 2 for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0048

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for OR
Tambo cooperatives sites for a period of thirty- six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0049

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for
Whittlesea cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0050

SCM SPECIFIC ENQUIRIES

Enquires: Mr. Z. Billie

Tel No.: 040-602 4563 / 4000

Cell No.:082 885 3425 during office hours
Email Address: zamuxolo.billie@ecdpw.gov.za

TECHNICAL ENQUIRES

Enquires: Mr. K Hughes

Tel No.: 040 602 4554 / 4000

Cell No.: 082 493 5858

Email Address: kevin.hughes@ecdpw.gov.za /

welile.mnyombolo@ecdpw.gov.za
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Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for
Ngcobo cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0051

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for Sarah
Baartman cluster 1 for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0052

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for
Queenstown cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0053

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for Cala
cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0054

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for Bhisho
cluster one (1) for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0055

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for Alfred
Nzo cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0056

Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for
Amathole Elliotdale cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

SCMU5-21/22-0057
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Bid for the appointment of service provider to provide safeguarding
and protection services to properties occupied by the state for
Amathole Fort Jackson cluster for a period of thirty-six (36) months.

REASONS FOR CANCELLATION

Technical errors in the bid specification/terms of reference.

The department regrets any inconveniences this may / might have
caused.
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PROVINCIAL TREASURY

The Eastern Cape Provincial Treasury urges all suppliers, who have not yet registered on the
National Treasury Central Supplier Database (CSD) to do so as a matter of urgency. The CSD is
a self-registration process, which can be completed online at www.csd.gov.za.

Contracted suppliers will not be able to receive orders or payments unless registered on the CSD.

Suppliers are encouraged to check their banking details verification after registering on the CSD
and ensure that the banking details are appearing on the CSD report as validated.

Suppliers are similarly encouraged to register and/or update their information on CSD.

Suppliers are welcome to visit the Provincial Treasury Helpdesk for assistance with registration,
especially those that do not have access to a computer and/or internet.

Enquiries must be directed to:

Sintu Dumezweni at 040 1010 436; sintu.dumezweni@ectreasury.gov.za
Zimkhitha Qina at 040 1010 359; zimkhitha.gina@ectreasury.gov.za
Xoliswa Mzimkulu at 040 1010 421; xoliswa.mzimkulu@ectreasury.gov.za;
Khanyiso Nginileyo at 040 1010 407; khanyiso.nginileyo@ectreasury.gov.za
Oswald Free at 040 1010 635; oswald.free@ectreasury.gov.za
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QUICK REFERENCE USER GUIDE
CENTRALISED SUPPLIERS DATABASE (CSD)

INTRODUCTION

This guide serves to assist users of the new Centralized Suppliers Database (CSD). By
following the steps in this quick reference guide access to the CSD and registration of
suppliers will be possible.

STEP 1
e Prospective users will have register as users on the CSD website and follow the
following actions;
1. Enter www.csd.gov.za in web browser

e The user is navigated to the CSD Home Page
2. Click on Register on the menu bar on the CSD Home Page
3. Enter your:
e E-mail address
e Name
e Surname
e Cellphone number
4. Select an identification type in the identification type dropdown
5. Enter identification number
—— If aforeign passport number or foreign ID number is entered then a work permit number
must also be entered
6. Enter a password
—— A password must contain a minimum of 8 characters and include a capital letter, a lower
case letter, a number
and a special character
7. Confirm password
8. Select and complete 3 security questions
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9. Check the | am not a robot Captcha
10. Check the | accept the terms and conditions
11. Click on the Register button
e The following message will be displayed: ‘Thank you for registering. An account
activation e-mail has been
e Sentto you'. In order for you to use your account, you will have to click the link in the
e-mail to activate your account.

e The account then needs to be activated. Please follow the following steps;

1. Open the CSD activation e-mail and click on the Activate Account link

—— A One Time Pin (OTP) is sent as an SMS to the cellphone number provided on the
registration screen
2. Enter the OTP in the Account Activation screen

3. Click on the Submit button
¢ The following message will be displayed: Account activated.
e The message will have a Log In link

STEP 2

¢ Once the account has been activated then suppliers can start to be captured onto the
CSD.

¢ By going to add supplier and clicking on each tab, supplier information is captured onto
the CSD by category.

¢ Information entered is verified automatically through National Treasury, via the CSD
linkages to various organizations.

e The last tab, Overview, gives detail on the progress of the application. Use it to
reference if any information has been omitted.

¢ Once no outstanding tasks are flagged in the Overview, the application can be
submitted by clicking SUBMIT.

e The supplier number and security code will then be generated for the supplier. Both are
extremely important and need to be recorded for safekeeping.

e The supplier is now registered on the CSD.

STEP 3
CONTINUED USE OF THE CSD

Should you at any time require any assistance with the CSD, please contact (012) 406
9222 or csd@treasury.gov.za or oswald.free@ectreasury.gov.za or by 040 1010 365.
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